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Forsyth County Procurement

DATE 9/30/21 ADDENDUM #2

Adrian Casey, Procurement Agent Il

Bid Number: 21-131-2210

Title: Forsyth County Fire Department
Uniforms & Accessories

Issuing Officer: Adrian Casey

Bid Initially Posted to Internet: 9/17/21

Email Address: acasey@forsythco.com

Telephone: 770-888-8872

This addendum supersedes and supplements all portions of the bidding documents and becomes
part of the contract documents for the above-referenced project. Where any item called for in the
specifications or indicated on the drawings is supplemented hereby, the original requirements
shall remain in effect. Where any original item is amended, voided or superseded hereby, the
provision of such item not so specifically amended, voided or superseded shall remain in effect.
QUESTIONS AND ANSWERS

# Questions

Referenced
Bid Section

Answers

1. | Please provide bid tabulation from
last bid

See attached.
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FORSYTH COUNTY
BID NO 18-97-2410
Provide Various Uniforms and Accessories for the Fire Department

**APPARENT BID RESULTS**

NAFE CO

Galls, LLC

Item #

Description

Brand and Item #

Unit Price

Lead Time
for
Delivery

Brand and Item #

Unit Price

Lead Time
for
Delivery

Brass - Smith & Warren #5155
Center insert: GAM multi-color Shell shall be
GOLD ELECTROPLATE
finish
First line: Rank as specified by FCFD
Second line: FORSTYH CO
Third line: FIRE DEPT

line: GA

Fourth
Lettering: Block
style/Black in color
Enamel type: soft/regular ~ Attachment: pin
& safety catch Shape:
curved No
Exceptions

Smith & Warren #5155

$55.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren
#5155

$47.50

30-60 Days
ARO

Lieutenant Collar Brass (one gold bar)
Premier Emblem 2nd LT Gold Mini Rank
Insignia
SKU:P1300
Item Code: MINIRANKINSIGNIA
Double clutch back - Set of two (2)
No Exceptions

Premier Emblem P1300

$5.65

30-60 Days

Premier Emblem #P1300

$2.73

30-60 days
ARO

Sergeant/FAO
Custom Commendation Bar
Premier Emblem P604
No Exceptions

Premier Emblem P604

$15.00

30-60 Days

Premier Emblem #P604

$3.04

30-60 Days
ARO

Captain Collar Brass (two gold bar)
Premier Emblem Captain gold mini rank
insignia
SKU: P1302
Item code: MINIRANKINSIGNIA
Double clutch back - Set of two (2)
No Exceptions

Premier Emblem P1302

$5.75

30-60 Days

Premier Emblem #P1302

$2.86

30-60 Days
ARO

Battalion Chief Collar Brass (3 stars in line)
Premier Emblem
Stars 3/8 Triple Gold
SKU: P1504
Item code: 38SMOOTHSTARS
Double clutch back - Set of two (2)
No Exceptions

Premier Emblem P1504

$15.00

30-60 Days

Premier Emblem #P1504

$7.59

30-60 Days
ARO

Division Chief Collar Brass (4 star cluster)
Premier Emblem
Star 3/8, 4 star cluster
P1602
3/8" cluster star
Item code:38CLUSTERSTARS
Double clutch back - Set of two (2)
No Exceptions

Premier Emblem P1602

$17.25

30-60 Days

Premier Emblem #P1602

$8.44

30-60 Days
ARO

Fire Chief Collar Brass (5 star cluster)
Premier Emblem Stars 3/8 five star cluster
SKU: P1604 3/8"
cluster star Item code:
38CLUSTERSTARS Double clutch
back - Set of two (2)

No Exceptions

Premier Emblem P1604

$17.50

30-60 Days

Premier Emblem #P1604

$8.44

30-60 Days
ARO

Firefighter Hat Badge
Smith & Warren #F143
Finish Gold Electroplate
First line: FORSYTH
Center: Solder numbers (sequence will be
provided by FCFD)

Second line: COUNTY
Lettering: Block style/Black in color
Enamel: soft/regular
Shape: curved
Attachment: screw
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #F143

$60.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #F143

$49.20

30-60 Days
ARO




Lieutenant Hat Badge
Smith & Warren #C105-one (1)
horizontal bugle
Finish: Gold Electroplate
Attachment: screw
Shape: curved/oval
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #C105

$20.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #C105-1

$18.27

30-60 Days
ARO

10

Captain Hat Badge
Smith & Warren #C117-
two (2) vertical bugles
Finish: Gold Electroplate
Attachment: screw
Shape: curved/oval
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #C117

$20.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #C117-2

$18.27

30-60 Days
ARO

11

Battalion Chief Hat Badge
Smith & Warren #C104-three (3) crossed
bugles
Finish: Gold Electroplate
Attachment: screw
Shape: curved/oval
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #C104

$20.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #C104-3

$18.27

30-60 Days
ARO

12

Division Chief Hat Badge
Smith & Warren #C103-four (4) crossed
bugles
Finish: Gold Electroplate
Attachment: screw
Shape: curved/oval
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #C103

$20.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #C103-4

$18.27

30-60 Days
ARO

13

Fire Chief Hat Badge
Smith & Warren #C102-five (5) crossed
bugles
Finish: Gold Electroplates
Attachment: screw
Shape: curved/oval
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #C102

$20.00

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #C102-5

$18.27

30-60 Days
ARO

14

Nameplates
Smith & Warren #C558A
Finish: Gold Electroplate
Lettering: Block style/Black in color ,
Attachment: Clutch back
Shape: Flat 2.5" x .5"
No Exceptions

Smith & Warren #C558A

$18.50

30-60 Days

Smith and Warren #C558-A

$14.59

30-60 Days
ARO

15

Class A Dress Pants
Meet or Exeed Anchor Uniform PN-229BL
Black in color shell is a blend of 55%
polyester 45% wool serge, fabric weight is
13.50z per sq yd expandable waistband with
hooks quarter top front pocket two cut in
side entry pockets two back pockets with
button tab on left split seam tailored HD
nylon fly zipper with auto lock slider bar
tacks at key stress points triangle bar tacks
on back pockets
Sizes 30-42

Anchor Uniform PN-229BL

$87.50

30-60 Days

Anchor Uniforms #PN-229BL

$96.92

30-60 Days
ARO

16

Same as above #15 Oversizes 44-52

Anchor Uniform PN-229BL

$95.00

30-60 Days

Anchor Uniforms #PN-229BL

$107.69

30-60 Days
ARO

17

Class A Dress Coat

Meet or Exceed Anchor Uniform 226BL, 32"

double breasted, shell 55% polyester, 45%
wool, permanent lining 100% polyester, two

bottom welt pockets and one top welt

pocket, two piece set in sleeve wiht shouldet

pads and sleeve heads, and 3 inside breast

pockets

Must match the Class A pants in the color

black, sizes: 36-50 in regular, long, and short

Anchor Uniform 226BL

$275.00

30-60 Days

Anchor #226BL

$270.77

30-60 Days
ARO

18

Same as above #17 Oversizes 52-54

Anchor Uniform 226BL

$290.00

30-60 Days

Anchor #226BL

$270.77

30-60 Days
ARO

19

Class A Dress Hat
Must meet or exceed Bayly's 07BS2D8 Black
and Bayly's 07GM2D8 White, More info,
black for FF-Captains
following sizes: 6-7/8 - 8.00

07BS2D8
07GM2D8

$80
$100.00

30-60 Days

Baylys #07BS2D8

$63.23

30-60 Days
ARO

20

Same as above #19 Chief's Hat white with
visor scramble

07GM2D8

$125.00

30-60 Days

Baylys #07GM2D8

$100.15

30-60 Days

ARO




Class A Dress Shoe
Must meet or exceed Bates E00941, high

30-60 Days

21 gloss upper, breathable moisture wicking Bates E00941 $90.00 30-60 Days Bates #E00941 $88.92 ARO
lining, vibram rubber outsole, Men sizes
range from 7-15
Same as above #21 men's half sizes 30-60 Days
22 B: E00941 . -60 D B: E00941 .92
71/2-1112 ates E009 $90.00 30-60 Days ates #E009: $88.9: ARO
Class A dress shoe, Must meet or exceed
Bates E00742high gloss upper, breathable 30-60 D
23 moisture wicking lining, vibram rubber Bates E00742 $90.00 30-60 Days Bates #E00742 $99.23 ARO ays
outsole,women's sizes 3 -
12,
Same as above #23 women's half 30-60 Days
24 Bates E00742 90.00 30-60 D Bates #E00742 99.23
sizes 31/2-111/2 ates $ as ates $ ARO
Class A Belt
Must meet or exceed Dutyman #1411 Govt. 30-60 D
25 Spec. genuine leather 1 1/4" in width, in the Dutyman #1411 $18.00 30-60 Days Dutyman #1411 $17.77 AF{O ays
color black, buckle must be gold. Sizes range
from 28-42
. 30-60 Days
26 Same as above #25 sizes 44-50 Dutyman #1411 $20.00 30-60 Days Dutyman #1411 $21.23 ARO
Class A Tie
Must meet or exceed Samuel Broom style " 30-60 Days
27 #900B0 Black clip-om 3.5 with button holes SB 90016 - 18 $6.00 30-60 Days Samuel Broome #90010 $3.89 ARO
Sizes for men 18,20,22
S b #27 sizes fi -
28 ame as above s/ sizes Tor women SB90156 $6.00 30-60 Days Samuel Broome #90156 $3.22 30-60 Days
crossover on 18 ARO
Long Sleeve Class A white shirt Mens Size: 14-17.5:
Must meet or exceed Southeastern Mens Southeastern Mens #3103 $33.50 $32.97 30-60 Days
29| 43103 and Womens #L1303, Sizes for mens |  Southeastern Wmns #3103 $33.50 8060 Days|  Southeastern #3103/L1303 |y meng Size 30-40: |ARO
neck size 14-18.5, FCFD patch left sleeve $32.97
Mens Size: 18-19
. . ] $36.26 30-60 Days
30 Same as above #29 mens neck size 19-20 Southeastern Mens #3103 $36.85 30-60 Days Southeastern #3103/L1303 Mens Size: 19.5-20 |ARO
$39.55
31 Same as above #29 womens bust size 30-44 Southeastern Wmns #3103 $34.00 30-60 Days Southeastern #3103/L1303 Womens 42-46 $36.26 i%go Days
32 Same as above #29 womens bust size 46-48 Southeastern Wmns #3103 $38.00 30-60 Days Southeastern #3103/L1303 Womens 48-50 $42.86 i%go Days
Duty Belts
Blackhawk 41CQ00BK
MIL-STD-858 with hut de buckl -
33 With parachute grade buckies Blackhawk 41CQO0BK $28.00 30-60 Days Blackhawk #41CQO0BK $29.21 30-60 Days
and adapters, black in color, hook/loop ARO
secure, running end, ranging in
sizes 32-60
$20.00 up to SZ
Dutyman Floral Leather #1761, 1 3/4 Ranger, 44 $22.00 SZ 32-44 $22.07 30-60 Days
34 D 1761 -60 D D 1761
black in color, sizes range from 32"-60" utyman #176 46-52 $25.00 80-60 Days utyman #176 46-52 $25.29 ARO
SZ 54-60
Travel/Training Polo Shirt
Cornerstone Select Snag Proof Tactical Polo
#CS410, in the following colors black, S-XL $36.91 30-60 Days
35 41 2. -60 D 41
charcoal, red, dark navy, tactical green, and Cornerstone CS410 $32.00 30-60 Days Cornerstone #CS410 2X-4X $41.52 ARO
tan with embroidery
No Exceptions
T-Shirts - Hanes Beefy-T #5180, 100% cotton
short sleeve, navy blue 30-60 D.
36 ranging in the following sizes, Small -Xlarge Hanes Beefy-T #5180 $10.50 30-60 Days Hanes #5180 $11.25 AF{O ays
has screen printing front/back
No Exception
. 30-60 Days
37 Same as above #36 sizes 2XLarge-5XLarge Hanes Beefy-T #5180 $12.00 30-60 Days Hanes #5180 $13.91 ARO
38 Same as above #36 add Tall Hanes Beefy-T #5180T $14.00 30-60 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
T-Shirts - Hanes Beefy-T #5180, 100% cotton
long sleeve, navy blue 30-60 D
39 ranging in the following sizes, Small -Xlarge Hanes Beefy-T #5180 $10.50 30-60 Days Hanes #5186 $18.20 AR-O ays
has screen print FCFD patch left chest and
Forsyth County Fire on the back
S b #39 sizes fi 2XL: - -
40 ame as above #39 sizes from ALarge $12.00 30-60 Days Hanes #5186 $20.12 30-60 Days
S5XLarge ARO
$12.50 SZ S-2XL
41 Same as above #39 add Tall option Hanes 5180T $15.00 SZ 3XL- | 30-60 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid

4XL




Physical Training Shorts
Must meet or exceed A4N5253-G44530

Gildan, 5.50z, 9" shorts with pockets, navy . . 30-60 Days
42 Gildan A4N5253-G44S30 13.00 30-60 D Gildan #A4N5253-G44S30 13.23
blue with FCFD screen print in white 3" block fcan $ ays fidan $ ARO
letters on left leg front, ranging in sizes from
small -XLarge
Same as above #39 sizes from 2XLarge- . Gildan #A4N5253-G44S30 2X: $16.09 30-60 Days
43 3Xlarge Gildan A4N5253-G44S30 $15.50 30-60 Days 3X: $16.09 ARO
Physical Training Sweat Pants
Must t d R | Athletic 596 -
s ustmeet or exceed Russel Athietic Russell Athletic 596 HBM $24.00 30-60 Days|  Russel Athletic #696HBM sm2xs16.03  |0-60Days
HBM, sizes Small - Xlarge, screen print left ARO
leg
45 Same as above #41 sizes 2XLarge-3XLarge Russell Athletic 596 HBM $25.50 30-60 Days Russel Athletic #696HBM 3X-4X $17.46 i%go Days
Physical Training Sweat Shirt
Must meet or exceed Russel Athletic 698
HBM Crew . . 30-60 Days
46 R Il Athl 25. -60 D R | Athl HBM 16.
Navy blue with 8 color FCFD patch screen ussell Athletic 698 $25.00 30-60 Days ussel Athletic #698 $16.03 ARO
print on left chest ranging in the following
sizes Small-Xlarge
. . ) 30-60 Days
47 Same as above #43 size 2XLarge-3XLarge Russell Athletic 698 $26.50 30-60 Days Russel Athletic #698HBM $17.46 ARO
Flex-Fit 6533 Ultra fiber ball cap, navy blue
ith FCFD broid front/center i -
4 |With FCFD cap embroidery on front/center in Flex-Fit 6533 $14.00 30-60 Days FlexFit #6533 $15.77 30-60 Days
white and gold ranging in sizes Small- ARO
Medium
" " 30-60 Days
49 Same as above #45 Large-Xlarge Flex-Fit 6533 $14.00 30-60 Days FlexFit #6533 $15.77 ARO
Flex-Fit 6577CD - Dark Navy with FCFD 30-60 D
50 embroidery on front center in white and Flex-Fit 6577CD $14.00 30-60 Days FlexFit #6577CD $16.15 AF{O ays
gold ranging in sizes Small - Meduiim
y y 30-60 Days
51 Same as above #47 Large - Xlarge Flex-Fit 6577CD $14.00 30-60 Days FlexFit #6577CD $16.15 ARO
5.11 Tactical Taclite Hat #89381 dark navy 30-60 D
52 FCFD cap embroidery on front/center in 5.1 Taclite Hat #89381 $15.00 30-60 Days 5.11 #89381 $17.22 ARO ays
white and gold
Fleece Beanie
Must meet or exceed Dragon Wear Nomex 30-60 D
53 Fleece, Big-chill Beanie, True North DF90, True North DF90 $22.00 30-60 Days|  Dragon Wear #DFB900DH $33.82 ARO ays
navy blue with FCFD embroidered on front
No Exceptions
Toboggan
Must meet or exceed Otto Cap Superior 30-60 D
54 | cotton knit beanie 12", #82-480, navy blue Otto Cap #82-480 $8.25 30-60 Days Otto Cap #82-840 $11.23 ARO ays
with FCFD embroidered in gold letters on
front
4" APEC Faceshield and Thumbwheel
Adjustments leather firefighter helmet and
composites. Height adjusters provide three
different headband height positions.
Ratcheting headband. Easy-to-adjust, quick-
release chinstrap with postmans slide. Black
55 NOMEX® flannel ear covers. Hand-carved Lion LFH4120E $675.00 30-60 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
brass eagle leather shield holder. Lime-
yellow 3M Scotchlite Reflective material.
Must be available in Black, Red, and White.
Helmet must meet Structral Fire Fighting
Helmet requirements of NFPA 197, 2007
Edition
Job Shirts
Must meet or exceed Tri Mountain #647
Alarm and Tri Mountain #644 react, navy
blue, 120z 80% cotton 20% poly 1/4 zip
sweatshirt must have mic pockets on Tri Mountain #647 Al i $44.00 30-60 D
. ri Mountain arm ri X ’ . . - ays
56 shoulders aer reinforced dual p.en pocket on Mountain #644 react $54.00 30-60 Days Tri Mountain #647 and #644 $62.69 ARO
left sleeve right chest pocket with hoop and
loop divider side pocket rib knit on cuffs,
FCFD patch left sleeve, badge left chest,
name strip right chest, EMS patch right
sleeve and collar rank to be sewn on.
Light Weight Jacket $52.50 SZ S-2XL
Must t d Dickies TJ15 lined . § -
57 ustmeet or exceed Dickies 115 ine Dickies TJ15 $56.50 SZ 3XL- | 30-60 Days Dickies #TJ15 $39.02 i‘;gﬂ Days

Eisenhower, FCFD patch left sleeve, badge
left chest to sew on, size Small-T - 5XLarge-T

5XL




All Weather Jacket (3:1, Reflective)
Must meet or exceed Blauer 9845-50 navy

58 | blue with zip-in 4650 navy fleece liner. FCFD Gerber 70RX-1 $200.00 | 30-60 Days Blauer #9845-50 $414.62 ,3\?;{80 Days
patch left sleeve, Badge left chest to sew on,
Ranging in the sizes Small -Xlarge
2X- $455.31 30-60 Days
59 Same as above #54 size 2XLarge - 4XLarge Gerber 70RX-1 $200.00 30-60 Days Blauer #9845-50 3X- $496.00 Y
ARO
4X- $536.69
. 30-60 Days
60 Same as above #54 size Large Tall -Xlarge Tall Gerber 70RX-1 $200.00 30-60 Days Blauer #9845-50 $414.62 ARO
. 2X Tall- $455.31
S b #54 2X L Tall - 4X -
61 o e e, Gerber 70RX-1 $200.00 | 30-60 Days Blauer #9845-50 aXTall- 349600 | S%0) PV
arge 1a 4X Tall- $536.69
Propper Tactical Pants #F5252-50 Khaki and 30-60 Days
62 Olive size 28-42 Propper #F5252-50 $33.00 30-60 Days Propper #F5252-50 $32.94 ARO
Same as ablove #58 Khaki and Olive size size 30-60 Days
63 44 and up Propper #F5252-50 $33.00 30-60 Days Propper #F5252-50 $32.94 ARO
Propper Snag Free Polo #F5322 Black and 30-60 Days
64 Silver Tan size S-2XL Propper #F5322 $35.00 30-60 Days Propper #F5322 $31.62 ARO
Same as above #60 30-60 Days
65 size 3XL and up Propper #F5322 $35.00 30-60 Days Propper #F5252-50 $31.62 ARO
5.11 Tactical Pants #74251 Khaki and Oli -
66 acticat Fants ki andOIVe | 5 14 Tactical Pants #74251 $40.00 30-60 Days 5.11 #74251 $40.49 30-60 Days
size 28-42 ARO
S b #62 -
67 ame as above 5.1 Tactical Pants #74251 $48.00 30-60 Days 5.11 #74251 $47.63 30-60 Days
size 44 and up ARO
5.11 Tactical Polo Short Sleeve #41060 Black, 30-60 D
68 Silver Tan, Green, and Navy 5.1 Tactical Polo #41060 $38.50 30-60 Days 5.11 #41060 $41.38 ao
size XS-2XL
Same as above #64 Black, Silver Tan, Green, 30-60 D
69 and Navy 5.11 Tactical Polo #41060 $45.00 30-60 Days 5.11 #41060 $46.15 ARO ays
size 3XL and up
5.11 Tactical Polo Long Sleeve #42056 30-60 D
70 Black, Silver Tan, Green, and Navy 5.11 Tactical Polo #42056 $42.75 30-60 Days 5.11 #42056 $46.14 ARO ays
size XS-2XL
Same as above #66 Black, Silver Tan, Green, 30-60 D
71 |and Navy size| 5.1 Tactical Polo #42056 $50.00 30-60 Days 5.1 #42056 $52.09 ao
3XL
Danner Acadia 8" #21210,with Safety Toe | Danner Acadia 8" #21210 lace in 30-60 Days
72 N 285. -60 D D 2121 4.
(lace in zipper #79300 must be provided) Zipper #79300 $285.00 80-60 Days anner # 0 $304.00 ARO
Danner Acadia 8" 22500,without Safety Toe | Danner Acadia 8" #22500 lace in 30-60 Days
73 N 292. -60 D D 22 12.77
(lace in zipper #79300 must be provided) Zipper #79300 $292.50 80-60 Days anner #22500 $3 ARO
74 Belleville MAXX 62 Belleville MAXX 6Z $100.00 | 30-60 Days Belleville MAXX 6Z $106.69 i‘;go Days
30-60 Days
75 Danner Patrol Boots #25200 Danner Patrol Boots #25200 $255.00 30-60 Days Danner #25200 $312.31 ARO
D: T t 45 4.5" boot: -
76 Danner Torrent 45 4.5" boots #43027 anner forren 00ts $140.00 30-60 Days Danner #43027 $150.54 30-60 Days
#43027 ARO
. . . 30-60 Days
77 Haix Airpower R2 boots Haix Airpower R2 boots $250.00 30-60 Days Haix #R2 Boots $285.23 ARO
Redback E E: 6" UBBK -
78 Redback Easy Escape 6" UBBK boots edbac as;‘):::pe $120.00 30-60 Days Redback Easy Escape UBBK $158.46 SA%gO Days
Rocky Paraboot Waterproof 10" Rocky Paraboot Waterproof 10" 30-60 Days
79 125.00 30-60 D Rocky #FQ0002095 127.71
#FQ0002095 boots #FQ0002095 boots $ as ocky #7Q $ ARO
Thorogood Quick Release 6" #804-6034 Thorogood Quick Release 6" #804- 30-60 Days
80 boots 6034 boots $85.00 30-60 Days Thorogood #804-6034 $94.77 ARO
Nomex Uniform Shirt Must meet NFPA 1975
Station Uniform Standard, Workrite #700NX-
#5°NB Mens Short Sleeve and #705NX45-NB 700NX-45-NB $97.00 Workrite #700NX-45-NB $109.23 30-60 Days
-45- . g i -45- . - V%
81 | MensLong Sleeve, FCFD patch left sleeve, 705NX-45-NB $10500 | 3060DS] yonite #705NX-45_NB $126.43 ARO
badge left chest, name strip right chest, EMS
patch right sleeve to be sewn on.
Ranging in the following sizes 38-50
. 700NX-45-NB $116.50 Workrite #700NX-45-NB $135.08 30-60 Days
82 Same as above #77 size 52-68 705NX-45-NB $126.00 80-60 Days Workrite #705NX-45_NB 156.60 ARO
700NX-45-NB $194.00 " " .
83 Same as above#77 add Tall 705NX-45-NB $210.00 30-60 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
Nomex Uniform Pant Must meet NFPA 1975 .
Station Uniform Standard 402NX75-NB $97.00 Workrite #402NX745-NB g:iz ig::g :uggg 30-60 Davs
84 Workrite #402NX75-NB Mens Pant 401NX75-NB $97.00 30-60 Days ) ARO Y
#401NX75-NB Womens Pant 402NX75-BK $112.00 Workrite #401NX75-NB 91.62
#402Nx75-BK Mens Pant Black
402NX75-NB $184.00
85 Same as above #81 add Tall 401NX75-NB $184.00 30-60 Days No Bid No Bid No Bid
402NX75-BK $224.00
Flashlight must be Streamlight Survivor
#90540 LED, 4 AA non-rechargeable . . . 30-60 Days
86 ligh 4 2. -60 D light 4 7.7
batteries, right angle/low profile, Streamlight Survivor #90540 $52.00 30-60 Days Streamlight #90540 $57.79 ARO
orange in color
Radio Strap must be Boston Leather #6543, 30-60 Days
87 B Leath 4 . -60 D B Leath .4
11/4 heavy duty leather strap/radio holder oston Leather #6543 $30.00 30-60 Days oston Leather $30.40 ARO




Radio Sti t be Boston Leather #5425 -
88 acio strap must be Boston Leather Boston Leather #5425 $10.00 30-60 Days Boston Leather #5425 $8.15 30-60 Days
Anti-Sway ARO
Radio Hold t be Boston Leath -
89 e Boston Leather #5487RC $25.00 30-60 Days|  Boston Leater #5487RC $32.15 i%go Days
Recruit Uniforms Pants
Must t d Dickies LP337BK, 100% . . -
go | vustmeetorexceed bickes RI3/BE, 1U0% Dickies LP337BK $28.50 30-60 Days Dickies #LP337BK $25.77 30-60 Days
cotton, black, ranging in the following sizes ARO
mens sizes 28-42
. . L 30-60 Days
91 Same as above #87 size 44-50 Dickies LP337BK $32.00 30-60 Days Dickies #LP337BK $28.39 ARO
T-Shirts Must be 100% Cotton, short sleeve,
full cut body and deep armholes, reinforced
taped neck and shoulder seams, Screen Print X . . . - Included in
92 FCFD patch on left chest and FIREFIGHTER Fruit of the Loom 3931 $9.00 30-60 Days Included in Pricing Included in Pricing Pricing
RECRUIT on back in 1 1/4 inch block letters.
Orange in color
S tches to b ided by FCFD - i
93 ew on patehes o be provided by F-H Included Included in Pricing Included in Pricing | nCluded in
Name Strips to be provided by supplier Pricing

THESE BIDS WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD ON THURSDAY SEPTEMBER 27, 2018 IN THE FORSYTH COUNTY PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT




