FORSYTH COUNTY
BID NO. 20-132-3150
Personal Protective Equipment for Forsyth County

*APPARENT BID RESULTS**

HKA Trading Inc. Norfl
Estimated Qty Description Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case
1,000 3-layer disposable level 1 surgical mask with ear loop blue 50 per box Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3
boxes — Must be FDA approved . . ..
which included description of Gloves
$ 4.45

80 boxes Medium

ITEM #29037 - SAFE GRIP POWDER FREE LATEX GLOVES - 50/BOX

BEADED CUFF OVER THE WRIST AND ARM CUFF THICKNESS 7.9/0.8

PALM THICKNESS.

11.4/0.8 FINGER THICKNESS

16.5-0.8/-12 LENGTH. 11. 8 $ 9.79

100 per box
200 Large
boxes ITEM #29037 - SAFE GRIP POWDER FREE LATEX GLOVES - 50/BOX

BEADED CUFF OVER THE WRIST AND ARM CUFF THICKNESS 7.9/0.8
PALM THICKNESS.

11.4/0.8 FINGER THICKNESS

16.5-0.8/-12 LENGTH. 11.8 $
100 per box

9.79




100
boxes

X-Large

ITEM #29037 - SAFE GRIP POWDER FREE LATEX GLOVES - 50/BOX
BEADED CUFF OVER THE WRIST AND ARM CUFF THICKNESS 7.9/0.8
PALM THICKNESS.

11.4/0.8 FINGER THICKNESS

16.5-0.8/-12 LENGTH. 11.8

100 per box

9.79

1,200
boxes

ITEM #US220 - ULTRASENSE POWER FREE NITRILE GLOVES, 100
PER BOX CUFF THICKNESS 2.8 PALM

THICKNESS 3.5 FINGER

THICKNESS LENGTH 9.6 ESTIMATED QUANTITIES SMALL 200/BOX;
MEDIUM 200/BOX, LARGE 400/BOX- LARGE 400/BOX

12.20

150 each

75 count disinfectant
wipes canister Kills 99.9% viruses/bacteria

No Bid

200
boxes

N95 mask flat shape 20 per box— no exceptions- Must be NIOSH approved with at
least
95% filter capacity

No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

86.64

200 N95 mask cone shape 20 per box— no exceptions - Must be NIOSH approved with
boxes at least 95% filter
capacity
20 cases Clorox All Purpose Cleaner 1440z Lemon and original scent -
3 per case
100 Purell Hand Sanitizer 8oz — 12 per case
cases
50 cases Clorox 4 in 1 Disinfecting & Sanitizer Aerosol 140z

— 12 per case

No Bid




100 each

All Purpose Disinfectant Cleaner kills 99.9% of germs and eliminates odors -
320z spray bottle

100
cases

Monk Disinfectant Wipes 800ct refills 8”x6” size and kills 99.99% of bacteria —
2 rolls per case

No Bid

No Bid




leet Distributors, LLC. Panacea Life Sciences, Inc. Maitri LLC
Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time
$ 14.50 [HUNAN ICARE |Available to ship | $ 12.00 |V-Joy Enterprise  |3-5 days
HEALTH CO.,LTD [out immediately Co. Ltd.
KZ-0120
Shield 5-7 Days
$ 17.00 |Blue Sail Medical [Available to ship [No bid No bid No bid
Co., Ltd. out immediately
Shield 5-7 Days
$ 17.00 |Blue Sail Medical [Available to ship [No bid No bid No bid
Co., Ltd. out immediately
Shield 5-7 Days




$ 17.00 |Blue Sail Medical [Available to ship [No bid No bid No bid
Co., Ltd. out immediately
Shield 5-7 Days
$ 17.00 |Blue Sail Medical [Available to ship [No bid No bid No bid
Co., Ltd. out immediately
Shield 5-7 Days
$ 4.25 No bid No bid No bid
CHUNGHO Price is per unit.
No Bid No Bid CLEANSING CO., |Available to ship
LTD. out immediately
NO BID No bid No bid No bid
No Bid No Bid




$ 1.35 |DONGGUAN Price is per unit. |No bid No bid No bid
LEIHUO Available to ship
MEDICAL out immediately
DEVICE CO., LTD
No Bid No Bid
NO BID No bid No bid No bid
No Bid No Bid
$ 3.95 No bid No bid No bid
ECIS Cosmetic Co Price is per unit.
Palm Palm 5-7 Days " |Available to ship
Ltd. . .
out immediately
NO BID No bid No bid No bid
No Bid No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

19.99

Available to ship
out immediately

No bid

No bid

No bid

No Bid

No Bid

NO BID

No bid

No bid

No bid




My Medical

JJ Supply Partners, Inc.

Think 360 Incorporat

Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model
$1.49|Xiamen DL Medical[10 days ARO US$5.50 Jesun
Technology
Model: DL-02 USA MADE
$ 16.00 RENSA 2 DAYS
HEALTH
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 9.90| SKY MED 3 DAYS
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 9.90| SKY MED 3 DAYS




No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
9.90 SKY MED 3 DAYS
No Bid No Bid No Bid 2.79|Clean Life 360
1450 NAKAWAT 2 DAYS
No Bid No Bid No Bid 3.99
SANI .
3.00 SUREACE 2 DAYS Pro Sanitize
No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.99(Tenamyd FM
182.50 PHG USA 2 DAYS

MADE




No Bid No Bid No Bid 39.99|Tenamyd FM
$ 78.00 MAKRITE 2 DAYS
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$ 10.11 CLOROX 2 DAYS
No Bid No Bid No Bid 22.25
$ 4.33 |GOJO PURELL 2 DAYS Clean Life 360
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
NO BID NO BID NO BID




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

9.96

CLOROX

2 DAYS

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NO BID

NO BID

NO BID

No Bid

No Bid




‘ed Vaswani Inc. National Bio+Green Sciences, LLC. B
Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case
Immediate Non-Responsive - Did not include any $17.99/BX of
Addendums 50
Vaswani Inc/VAS-
$6.00 3PLY-L1 1-2 Weeks
No Bid $15.50/BX of
50
No Quote No Quote No Quote
No Bid $15.50/BX of
50
No Quote No Quote No Quote




No Bid

$15.50/BX of
50

$12.50/BX of
100

No Quote No Quote No Quote
5 days
Vaswani Inc/VAS-
GL-N1-S/VAS-GL-
$16.00 NL-M/VAS-GL-N1- 3-4 Weeks
L/VAS-GL-N1-XL
5 days No Quote No Quote No Quote
5 days
No Quote No Quote No Quote

$108.00/CS of
12 Tubs

$82.00/BX of
35




5 days

$13.82/BX of
20

$116.72/CS of
4

No Quote No Quote No Quote
No Bid

No Quote No Quote No Quote
Immediate $21.00 Purell / \F/),:s-soz- 1-3 Weeks
No Bid

$102.00 Aero/483720LA 1-3 Weeks

$65.52/CS of
24

$52.08/CS of
12




No Bid

$6.00

Spartan/102103

1-3 Weeks

No Bid

$80

VAS/VAS-QBW-
900B1-WR

1-3 Weeks

$45.24/CS of 6

$73.80/CS of
12 Tubs




ound Tree Medical

LNJ Capital Inc

ReadyMax, Inc.

Manufacturer/Model

Est Delivery Time

Price Per Box/Case

Manufacturer/Model

Est Delivery Time

Price Per Box/Case

Manufacturer/Model

Est Delivery Time

MEDSOURCE (Delivery times
INTERNATION |cannot be
AL - IMPORT / [guaranteed due
MS-12127 to high demand| $ 2.40| JCJZ/TB-01 10 DAYS
and low
availability.
ANSELL Delivery times
HEALTHCARE [cannot be
PRODUCTS guaranteed due
LLC/SG-375- [to high demand No Bid No Bid No Bid
M and low
availability.
ANSELL Delivery times
HEALTHCARE [cannot be
PRODUCTS guaranteed due
LLC / SG-375-L [to high demand No Bid No Bid No Bid

and low
availability.

Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3

which included description of Gloves




ANSELL

Delivery times

HEALTHCARE [cannot be
PRODUCTS guaranteed due
LLC /SG-375- [to high demand
XL and low No Bid No Bid No Bid
availability.
ANSELL Delivery times
HEALTHCARE [cannot be
PRODUCTS guaranteed due .
LLC / US-220-S |to high demand| $ 18.00 Intco/Nitrile 10 DAYS
and low Gloves
availability.
Delivery times
METREX cannot be
RESEARCH guaranteed due . . .
CORPORATIO |to high demand No Bid No Bid No Bid
N /13-1100 and low
availability.
O&M Delivery times
HALYARD / [cannot be
46727 guaranteed due Harley
to high demand| ¢ 50.00 | Commodity/L- | 10 DAYS
and low 188

availability.




DUKAL CORP.
/1571

Delivery times
cannot be
guaranteed due

to high demand| $ 70.00( 3M/1860 10 DAYS
and low
availability.
METREX Delivery times
RESEARCH cannot be
CORPORATIO |guaranteed due
N / 13-5000 to high demand No Bid No Bid No Bid
and low
availability.
Delivery times
wATERIEL [
TECHNOLOGI 0 high demand No Bid No Bid No Bid
ES / HSP8-24
and low
availability.
CENTRAL Delivery times
SOLUTIONS, [cannot be
INC/ guaranteed due
PHEN18539 to high demand No Bid No Bid No Bid

and low
availability.




SAFETEC/
34810

Delivery times
cannot be
guaranteed due
to high demand
and low
availability.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NICE-PAK/
Q89072

Delivery times
cannot be
guaranteed due
to high demand
and low
availability.

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Sports Brand Group, Inc.

US Health Express Corp

American Terry Mills,

Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model
Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3 Non-Responsive - Did not ir
which included description of Gloves Addendums
$ 4.00 KM Care 2-3 Weeks
No Bid No Bid No bid
No Bid No Bid No bid




No Bid No Bid No bid
Formosa/TWEC-
11.95 GLV-1618 2-3 Weeks
8.75 Clorox 3 Weeks
No Bid No Bid No bid




75.00| Makrite/910-N95 2-3 Weeks
No Bid No Bid No bid
No Bid No Bid No bid
No Bid No Bid No bid




8.25

3M/Spray Nine

3 Weeks

No Bid

No Bid

No bid




LLC. Interboro Packaging Corporation Stalwart
Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case
1clude any NB NB NB $4/box Ganzhou PP3- |5 days
ply
$23.50
NB NB NB $14.5/box Nitrihand 5 days
$20.15
NB NB NB $14.5/box Nitrihand 5 days

$20.15




NB NB NB $14.5/box Nitrihand 5 days
$20.15
$29.75/Box,  |Aurelia-Small- [3-7 Days ARO |$14.5/box Nitrihand 5 days
$297.50/Case. |NPFG, Mfr:
Supermax. As
per sample #5.
NB NB NB $5.35/canister
Herclean 80
count/canister 14 days
NB NB NB $125.00/box of |PHG - 5 days
50. Protective

$2.50/mask

Health Gear




NB NB NB $51/box of 20 |Xiantao N95 10 days

$2.55 per mask (hard cup

$50.99
NB NB NB $75/case Avistat-D 4/1g |5 days
jugs

NB NB NB 70% Gel 8oz

with pump. 24

bottles per case.

$l.4/b0tt|e, Froggy's 70%

$168 for 12 Gel with pump 5 days $6000

bottles,

$33.6/case
NB NB NB $65.25/case Chase SprayPak (5 days

12-16.50z/case




NB NB NB $4.68/320z Avistat - D 5 days
bottle 12/320z bottles
per case
$4.05
NB NB NB No Bid No Bid No Bid




Home Depot Pro

HMS Industries

The Vertical Collective

Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time
Non-Responsive - Did not include any $17.00 per Box |SMX21008 14 - 17 Days
Addendums $850.00 per
Case
Great Star
#313434564 5-10 days
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Big Time
#313567652 5-10 days
No Bid No Bid No Bid
Big Time 5-10 days

#313567679




Big Time
#313567691

5-10 days

No Bid No Bid No Bid
$15.75 per Box |[SMX21006 14 - 17 Days
$315.00 per

Case

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid




Dasheng

#313372757 5-10 days
GoJo
#313933484 5-10 days

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid




Clorox
#CLO35417

5-10 days

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




UniPak Corp.

Centric Group

Texas Medical Center Supy

Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model
2.75|Yixin 3ply 1-10 days 10|OKSafe Medical | 7-10 day $7.50| TMCS/3PLY-
NONSURG-01
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50{ TMCS/LAT-GL-
001
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50{ TMCS/LAT-GL-

001




No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $11.50|TMCS/LAT-GL-
001
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $27.50|TMCS/NIT-BL-001
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID
52|Makrite Sekura |1-10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID




56|Makrite Sekura |1-10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid $75|TMCS/N95-WH-01
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $42.00
TMCS/NATU-HS-
08
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid NO BID NO BID




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NO BID

NO BID

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

NO BID

NO BID




ly, LLC. Planet Halo, Inc. Nationwide Source Inc.

Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case

15 Days Non-Responsive - Did not include any Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3 Non-Respc
Addendums which included description of Gloves

15 Days

15 Days




15 Days

15 Days

NO BID

NO BID




15 Days

NO BID

15 Days

NO BID




NO BID

NO BID




ZEV Supplies Everready First Aid Grogreen Solutions
Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time
nsive - Did not include any $ 9.50 [EVER READY |7 DAYS Non-Responsive - Did not include any
Addendums 1600083 Addendums
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




KAN Heritage Inc. Kentron Healthcare, Inc. Protex Labs

Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model

Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3| Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3] Non-Responsive - Did not includ
which included description of Gloves which included description of Gloves which included description













IP Med Inc.

Elite Textile Trading, LLC.

Est Delivery Time

Price Per Box/Case

Manufacturer/Model

Est Delivery Time

Price Per Box/Case

Manufacturer/Model

Est Delivery Time

Price Per Box/Case

le Addendum 3
of Gloves

$ 3.75

Weihai Hai Na
Bai Chuan
Pharmaceutical
Group

7-10 Days

$ 19.00

AmerCare -
Edge Indigo

7-10 Days

$ 19.00

AmerCare -
Edge Indigo

7-10 Days

Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3

which included description of Gloves

10

No Bid

No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

$ 19.00 |AmerCare - 7-10 Days
Edge Indigo

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

3.5

60




29.25

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid

43.49

53.28




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

4.8

145.24




)ffice Depot, LLC. EDC3, LLC ZeroShels, LLC.
Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time
6258650 immediately  |Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3
Wanxinda which included description of Gloves

$19.00 5-7 days
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid
7324956

Cleanitize Immediately
Cleaning

9879715 BYD [Immediately

Care N95

No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid




536387 Clorox
Pine Sol

1/15/2021

603170 Purell

1/15/2021

7584965 Clorox

1/15/2021

$108.00 5 -7 days
No Bid No Bid No Bid
$32.28 Lig’e‘;‘;rtthe 3-5 days
No Bid No Bid No Bid




115581 Clorox
Cleanup

1/15/2021

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

5997314 Betco
Big Bucket

1/15/2021

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




Maybe Mars LLC

Avenue Medical Equipment, Inc.

LT Printing & Promotion

Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model
1.645(JCI2 TB-01 7 days 2.25perbox  |Sunway SW-  |12-14 days 13.5|DSB Medical
$0.045per mask (0617
15|Shamrock Supreme |7 days No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.90/box Tuff Grip
100/box
10/case
15|Shamrock Supreme |7 days No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.90/box Tuff Grip
100/box

10/case




15[Shamrock Supreme |7 days No Bid No Bid No Bid 16.90/box Tuff Grip
100/box
10/case
15|Shamrock Supreme (7 days No Bid No Bid No Bid 23.90/box Lungsal
100/box
10/case
2 7 days No Bid No Bid No Bid 12.75
Magicare (80/pack) Lysol
2.09Makrite SEKURA- |7 days 37.80 per box |Harley 4-8 days 3.9(Benehal
N95

$1.89 each




2.89[Makrite 9500-N95 |7 days 44.00 per box |Harley 4-8 days 3.8|makrite
$2.20 each
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 62.1
Purell
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

45.5

Monk




I, LLC. Pelv-Ice Altronics Nashville Vv
Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case
10days 3.39 / box Sunway 7 days $6.00/box Runfuxiang/RFX01 |3-5 weeks Non-Respc
1-3days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1-3days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




1-3 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

1-5 days No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6.88 / each Invisishield 10 days No Bid No Bid No Bid

1-5 days

3-7days 44.80 / box Makrite 14 days $40.00/box Benehal/MS8225  [3-5 weeks




5-7 days 44.80 / box Makrite 14 days $45.00/box Benehal/6115L 3-5 weeks
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
1668 / case No Bid No Bid No Bid
3-5 days Orbit 10 days
No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid




No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

3-5 days

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid




ledical & EMS Products, Inc. UWePort

Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time Price Per Box/Case Manufacturer/Model Est Delivery Time

nsive - Did not include any Non-Responsive - Did not include Addendum 3
Addendums
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