

FORSYTH COUNTY
BID NO. 21-121-2210
Sheriff's Office Uniforms & Duty Gear

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
Belts								
1	Bucklesless Duty Belt, 2.25" Black Basketweave	Safariland 94-xx-4	50	No Bid				
2	Buckleless Garrison Belt, 1.5" Black Basketweave	Safariland 99-x-4	50	No Bid				
Duty Gear								
3	Handcuff Pouch Basket Weave Chain Cuff Hidden Snap	Safariland 90-4HS	50	No Bid				
4	Top Flap Hidden Snap Handcuff Pouch Basket Weave Hinged Cuffs	Safariland 90H-4HS	50	No Bid				
5	Double Magazine Pouch Hardshell STX Basketweave Belt loop Group 1	Safariland 77-083-48HS	50	No Bid				
6	Slimline Open Top Triple Magazine Pouch Black Hardshell STX STX Basketweave Belt Loop Group 5	Safariland 775-83-48	50	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
Duty Gear								

7	OC Spray Holder Hidden Snap Hardshell STX STX Basketweave Belt Loop MK-3 and similar	Safariland 38-4-48HS	50	No Bid				
8	Open Top Mini Flashlight Holder Black Hardshell STX STX Basketweave Group 11	Safariland 306-11-48	50	No Bid				
9	Surgical Glove Holder Basket Weave Single Pair of gloves	Safariland 33-4V	50	No Bid				
10	Hidden Snap Belt Keeper 1" Basketweave	Safariland 62-4-4HS	50	No Bid				
11	Model 100 Nickel Finished Handcuff	Smith & Wesson 350103	50	\$ 21.79	\$ 1,089.50	N/A	N/A	N/A
12	Hinged Handcuffs	Smith & Wesson 350096	50	\$ 24.79	\$ 1,239.50	N/A	N/A	N/A
13	Rotating sidebreak basketweave baton holder	ASP 52433	50	\$ 33.61	\$ 1,680.50	N/A	N/A	N/A
14	Universal Radio Holder w/Swivel	Bianchi 7314S-18521	50	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Duty Gear							
15	Mace/OC Spray holder Belt Loop 2"- 2.25" Hidden Snap MK-2 MK-3 and similar (small)	Bianchi 7307-18205	50	No Bid				

16	Mace/OC Spray holder Belt Loop 2"- 2.25" Hidden Snap MK-4 and similar (large)	Bianchi 7307- 18205	50	No Bid				
17	Compact Light Holder Size 2	Bianchi 7326- 22838	50	No Bid				
18	Glove Pouch Hidden Snap	Bianchi 7315- 18481	50	No Bid				
Men's Boots								
19	Fat Maxx Side zip Tactical Boot	Tactical Research MAXX 6Z	50	No Bid				
20	6" Kinetic Side Zip Waterproof Boot	Danner 28017	25	No Bid				
21	ATAC 2.0 6" Side Zip Quarter Boot	5.11 Tactical 12394-019	25	No Bid				
22	6" Duty Side-Zip Boot	First Tactical 165001-019	25	No Longer Available				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
Men's Boots								
23	5" Tactical Sport Boot	Bates E02262	25	\$ 110.00	\$ 2,750.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
24	Maxx 8" Size Zip Boot	Tactical Research MAXX 8Z	25	No Bid				
25	ATAC 2.0 8" Side Zip Duty Boot	5.11 Tactical 12391-019	25	No Bid				
26	8" Stellar Tactical Boot	Under Armor 1268951	50	No Bid				
27	8" Zipper Composite Toe Boot	Bates E02263	50	\$ 130.00	\$ 6,500.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
28	8" GX Side Zip Gore-Tex Boot	Bates E02268	50	\$ 170.00	\$ 8,500.00	N/A	N/A	N/A

29	8" Tactical Sport Zipper Boot	Bates E02261	50	\$ 120.00	\$ 6,000.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
30	8" Deuce Side Zip Waterproof Boot	Thorogood 834-6219	50	\$ 125.00	\$ 6,250.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
31	8" Side Zip Waterproof Composite Toe Boot	Thorogood 804-6191	50	\$ 130.00	\$ 6,500.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
32	8" Zipper Boot	Rocky Fort Hood 2149	25	No Bid				
33	Classic Oxford Low Cut	Thorogood 831-6027	25	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,500.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
34	6" Kinetic Gore-Tex Waterproof Boot	Danner 28015	25	No Bid				
35	Men's 6" Side Zip Duty Boots	First Tactical 165001-019	25	No Longer Available				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Men's Boots							
36	Men's 6" Side Zip Duty Boots	First Tactical 165001-019	25	No Longer Available				
37	Men's 8" Commando Boot	Thorogood 831-6823	50	\$ 155.00	\$ 7,750.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Women's Boots							
38	6" Women's Waterproof Boot	Rocky Alpha Force 4167	25	No Bid				
39	Women's ATAC 2.0 6" Side Zip Quarter Boot	5.11 Tactical 12404-019	25	No Bid				
40	Women's 5" Tactical Sport Boot	Bates E02762	25	\$ 110.00	\$ 2,750.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
41	Women's ATAC 2.0 8" Side Zip Duty Boot	5.11 Tactical 12403-019	25	No Bid				
42	Women's Stellar Tactical 2E Boot	Under Armour 1276374	50	No Bid				
43	Women's GX-8 Non-Metallic Waterproof Zipper Boot	Bates E02788	25	\$ 170.00	\$ 4,250.00	N/A	N/A	N/A

44	Alpha Force Women's Waterproof 8" Boot	Rocky 4165	25	No Bid				
45	Cross Trainer Plus Boots	Thorogood 831-6833	25	\$ 150.00	\$ 3,750.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
46	8" Commando Plus Boot	Thorogood 831-6823	25	\$ 155.00	\$ 3,875.00	N/A	N/A	N/A

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Women's Boots							
47	Women's Hi-Gloss Dress Oxford	Thorogood 531-6303	25	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,500.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
48	7" Urban Operator Waterproof Boot	First Tactical 165015	25	\$ 140.00	\$ 3,500.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
49	7" Urban Operator Boot	First Tactical 165014	25	\$ 130.00	\$ 3,250.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
	Trousers/Pants Hemmed to Deputy's inseam							
50	6 pocket Men Pants Black	Blauer 8657-11	850	No Bid				
51	6 pocket Women's Pants-Black	Blauer 8657W-11	55	No Bid				
52	TENX BU Pants Black	Blauer 8831-11	50	No Bid				
53	Women's TENX BDU Pants Black	Blauer 8831W-11	50	No Bid				
54	Motorcycle Breeches Black	5.11 Tactical 74407-019	10	No Bid				
55	24/7 Men's Tactical Pant Series Olive Drab	Tru-Spec 1064-ODG	200	No Bid				
56	24-7 Series Women's Tactical Pant Olive Drab	Tru-Spec 1099-ODG	100	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	

	Trousers/Pants Hemmed to Deputy's inseam							
57	Men's FlexRS Covert Tactical Pant with Tunnel Waistband Black	Blauer 8666	850	No Bid				
58	Women's FlexRS Covert Tactical Pant with Tunnel Waistband Black	Blauer 8666W	55	No Bid				
	Uniform Dress Shirts							
59	Men's Short Sleeve Polyester Supershirt Black <i>Shoulder patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8675- 11	75	No Bid				
60	Women's Short Sleeve Supershirt Black <i>Shoulder patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8675W- 11	35	No Bid				
61	Men's Long Sleeve Supershirt Black <i>Shoulder patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8670- 11	250	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Uniform Dress Shirts							
62	Women's Long Sleeve Supershirt Black <i>Shoulder patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8670W- 11	25	No Bid				
63	Men's FlexRS Long Sleeve Supershirt Black	Blauer 8671	250	No Bid				

64	Women's FlexRS Long Sleeve Supershirt Black	Blauer 8671W	25	No Bid				
65	Men's FlexRS Short Sleeve Supershirt Black	Blauer 8676	250	No Bid				
66	Women's FlexRS Short Sleeve Supershirt Black	Blauer 8676W	25	No Bid				
Outerwear								
67	Softshell Fleece Jacket Black Sew Patch & Breast Badge Shoulder and Badge patches sewn on	Blauer 4660-11	50	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
Outerwear								
	add Epaulets	Each	As needed	No Bid				
	add Gold S Buttons	Each	As needed	No Bid				
68	Reversible Windbreaker Black side has shoulder patches and breast badge. "SHERIFF" in reflective silver on back. Not patches on yellow side. (4) Gold S Buttons	Blauer 8720	100	No Bid				
69	B. Dry Reversible Rain Jacket w/logo and Sheriff in reflective letters on Hi-Vis side	Blauer 236R	100	No Bid				

70	Snap On Rain Hood Black	Blauer Blau-123	100	No Bid				
71	Reversible IKE Length Duty Jacket Black/Hi Vis	Rothco 8720	100	No Bid				
72	B. Dry Reversible Rain Jacket Black/Hi-Vis	Blauer 736	100	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Armorskin							
73	Armorskin XP Vest Cover Black	Blauer 8370XP-11	400	No Bid				
74	Men's Short Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black <i>Shoulder and badge patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8372-11	700	No Bid				
75	Women's Short Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black <i>Shoulder and badge patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8372W-11	50	No Bid				
76	Long Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black <i>Shoulder and badge patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8371-11	150	No Bid				
77	Women's Long Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black <i>Shoulder and badge patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8371W-11	50	No Bid				
78	Tenx Armorskin XP Vest Cover- Sew on Badge Black	Blauer 8780XP-11	20	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Armorskin							
79	Unisex Short Sleeve B. Du Armorskin Base Shirt Black <i>Shoulder and badge patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8782-11	45	No Bid				
80	Unisex Long Sleeve B. Du Base Shirt Black <i>Shoulder and badge patches only sewn on</i>	Blauer 8781-11	30	No Bid				
81	Men's FlexRS Long Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black	Blauer 8361	150	No Bid				
82	Women's FlexRS Long Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black	Blauer 8361W	50	No Bid				
83	Men's FlexRS Short Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black	Blauer 8362	700	No Bid				
84	Women's FlexRS Short Sleeve Armorskin Base Shirt Black	Blauer 8362W	50	No Bid				
85	FlexRS Armorskin XP Ballistic Vest Carrier Black	Blauer 8360XP	400	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Accessories							
86	Black Skull Cap	Blauer 160-11	300	No Bid				
87	Black Tie 14.5"	S. Broome 90057-BLK	25	No Bid				

88	Black Tie 18"	S. Broome 90016-BLK	250	No Bid				
89	Black Tie 20"	S. Broome 90049-BLK	100	No Bid				
90	Black Tie 22"	S. Broome 90063-BLK	20	No Bid				
91	SBA Body Armor Level II - Point Blank AXII w(1) HiLite Carrier & 5x8 STP	Safariland Body Armor SBA-SX02-II	150	\$ 657.00	\$ 98,550.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
92	Concealable Black Carrier- Pint Blank PerformX HiLite	Safariland SBA-M2	300	\$ 89.00	\$ 26,700.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
93	SBA Soft Trauma Plate- Point Blank Soft Trauma	Safariland SBA- STP-5X8	300	\$ 39.00	\$ 11,700.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
94	Body Armor Set Impac MT 5X8 Hard Plate-Point Blank 5x8 Speed Plate	ProTech 1001632	150	\$ 78.00	\$ 11,700.00	N/A	N/A	N/A
Polo Shirts								
95	Snap-Proof Tactical Polo Black and Charcoal Forsyth County Breast Badge Sewn on Left Chest	CornerStone CS410	350	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
Polo Shirts								
96	Men's Long Sleeve Snag- Proof Tactical Polo Black and Charcoal Forsyth County Breast Badge Sewn on Left Chest	CornerStone CS410LS	100	No Bid				
97	Ladies Snag-Proof Tactical Polo Charcoal and Black Forsyth Breast Badge Sewn on Left Chest	CornerStone CS411	100	No Bid				

98	Industrial Snag-Proof Pique Polo Charcoal and Black Embroidered Logo: Forsyth County Sheriff's Office Left Chest	CornerStone CS4020	200	No Bid				
99	Ladies Select Lightweight Snag-Proof Polo Charcoal and Black Embroidered Logo: Forsyth County Sheriff's Office Left Chest	CornerStone CS419	150	No Bid				
Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	Brim Hats							
100	Triple Brim Campaign Hat-Black	Stratton S40TB	As needed	No Bid				
101	Triple Brim Campaign Hat-Black Long Oval to include gold cord and black strap	Stratton S40DB	As needed	No Bid				
102	Campaign Hat Reversible Rain Covers	475RHC	As needed	No Bid				
103	Felt Campaign Hat Black to include gold cord and black strap	F-40	As needed	No Bid				
104	Gold Cords	Stratton CD-GD	As needed	No Bid				
105	Silver Cords	Stratton CD-SR	As needed	No Bid				
106	Chin Strap- Black	ST-3P-BK	As needed	No Bid				
107	Brim Holder	Stratton Brim Holder	As needed	No Bid				

	IRT Uniforms <i>Sew on Forsyth County Olive Drab Green Back Patch (supplied by Forsyth) and Forsyth County Present Badges</i>							
108	Taclite Pro RipStop Pant-TDU Green	5.11 Tactical 74273-190	75	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
						Beginning	Ending	
	IRT Uniforms <i>Sew on Forsyth County Olive Drab Green Back Patch (supplied by Forsyth) and Forsyth County Present Badges</i>							
109	Women's Taclite Pro Ripstop Pant TDU Green	5.11 Tactical 64360-190	75	No Bid				
110	Taclite Pro Long Sleeve Shirt TDU Green	5.11 Tactical 72175-190	75	No Bid				
111	Women's Taclite Pro Long Sleeve Shirt TDU Green	5.11 Tactical 62070-190	75	No Bid				
112	Ladies Fleece Jacket Black and Iron Gray <i>Embroider Logo: Forsyth County Sheriff's Office in Gold</i>	Port Authority L217	25	No Bid				
113	Value Fleece Jacket Black and Iron Gray <i>Embroider Logo: Forsyth County Sheriff's Office in Gold</i>	Port Authority F217	25	No Bid				

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes	Unit Price for Premium Sizes
	Badges & Chevrons						

114	7 Point Star Badge Hi-Glo with blue GA Seal Safety Catch	Blackington B1277	As needed	\$ 84.50	As Needed			
115	7 Point Star Badge Hi-Glo With blue GA Seal Wallet Clip	Blackington VHB-B1277	As needed	\$ 84.50	As Needed			
116	7 Point Star Badge Hi-Glo with blue GA Seal Screw Post	Blackington B748	As needed	\$ 79.00	As Needed			
117	Hidden Badge Wallet Dress- Black SC198 badge cut-out	Strong 79520	As needed	\$ 20.00	As Needed			
118	Small Private Chevron, shirt collar size Gol-Tone	Blackington J132	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
119	Large Private Chevron, jacket size Gol-Tone	Blackington J132-A	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
120	Small Corporal Chevron, shirt collar size Gol-Tone	Blackington J131	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
121	Large Corporal Chevron, jacket size Gol-Tone	Blackington J131A	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			

Line #	Description	MFG/MAKE	Est Qty	Unit Price for Regular Sizes	Extended Prices (Regular Sizes)	Size Range for Premium Sizes		Unit Price for Premium Sizes
	Badges & Chevrons							
122	Small Sergeant Chevron, shirt collar size Gol-Tone	Blackington J130	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
123	Large Sergeant Chevron, jacket size Gol-Tone	Blackington J130A	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
124	Small Lieutenant Bar Shirt collar size Nickel or Gol-Tone	Blackington J61	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			

125	Large Lieutenant Bar Jacket Size Nickel or Gol-Tone	Blackington J62	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
126	Small Captain Bars Shirt collar size Gol-Tone	Blackington J63	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
127	Large Captain Bars Jacket Size Gol-Tone	Blackington J64	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
128	Small Major leaves Shirt collar size Gol-Tone	Blackington J65	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			
129	Large Major leaves Jacket Size Gol-Tone	Blackington J66	As needed	\$ 7.90	As Needed			