
Vulcan Materials Mid-South Aggregates Martin Marietta

TYPE OF MATERIAL COST PER TON COST PER TON COST PER TON

Aggregate Size #4 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Aggregate Size #5 No Bid  $                                          24.00  $                                  24.75 

Aggregate Size #7  $                                       25.85  $                                          28.00  $                                  28.00 

Aggregate #S‐3 No Bid No Bid No Bid

Aggregate Size #10 No Bid No Bid  $                                  20.40 

Aggregate Size #34  $                                       22.85 No Bid  $                                  23.75 

Aggregate Size #57  $                                       22.85  $                                          24.00  $                                  24.75 

Aggregate Size #89 Washed  $                                       24.35  $                                          24.50  $                                  25.75 

Aggregate Size #810  $                                       21.35  $                                          24.25 No Bid

Aggregate Size Surge Stone  $                                       22.85  $                                          23.25  $                                  24.00 

Aggregate Graded Aggregated Base  $                                       19.35  $                                          20.50  $                                  18.25 

FORSYTH COUNTY 
BID NO.  21-158-3120
Aggregate As Needed

**APPARENT BID RESULTS**



Aggregate Com. Gab No Bid  $                                          17.75  $                                  18.25 

Rip Rap Type 1  $                                       27.85  $                                          30.00  $                                  30.00 

Rip Rap Type 3  $                                       27.85  $                                          28.00  $                                  28.75 

AW10 Asphalt Sand No Bid  $                                          27.75  $                                  27.25 

M‐10 Sand No Bid  $                                          19.75  $                                  20.40 

Manufactured Sand  $                                       23.35  $                                          27.75  $                                  27.25 

Quartz Sand No Bid No Bid  $                                  31.00 

River Sand No Bid No Bid No Bid

Plant Locations 4420 Hightower Rd. 
Ballground, GA 30107            
983 Red Oak Flats Rd. 
Dahlonega, GA 30533

3561 Peachtree Pkwy. 
Suwanee, GA 30024

2015 Ronald Reagan Blvd. 
Cumming, GA 30041

* Price quoted are FOB Forsyth 
Quarry Only

THESE BIDS WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD ON NOVEMBER 18, 2021 IN THE FORSYTH 
COUNTY PROCUREMENT DEPARTMENT. 


