Landscaping Services and Detention Pond Clearing

FORSYTH COUNTY
BID NO. 21-191-1620

**APPARENT BID RESULTS**

COMPANY NAME: Total Cost Section A Total Cost Section B Total Cost Section C

Sawnee Outdoors No Bid $22,000.00 No Bid
NaturChem No Bid $14,800.00 No Bid

ACS Landscape $172,132.00 $15,064.50 $62,623.00

Ed Castro Landscape Inc $386,000.00 $36,000.00 $74,651.67

McCade Group $161,250.00 $14,500.00 $36,200.00

Ruppert Landscape No Bid $53,694.00 $127,228.00
Yellowstone Landscape $188,888.00 $20,500.00 No Bid

REMS Property Management LLC $154,742.00 $11,788.00 $71,755.00

THESE BIDS WERE OPENED AND READ ALOUD ON DECEMBER 9, 2021 IN THE FORSYTH COUNTY PROCUREMENT

DEPARTMENT.
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