FORSYTH COUNTY
BID NO. 21-168-3330
Lead Free Water Parts

Delta Core & Core &
**APPARENT BID RESULTS** Delta Municipal Municipal Ferguson Ferguson Main Main
UNIT
ITEM # DESCRIPTION EST QTY[ UNIT COST BRAND | UNIT COST| BRAND COST BRAND

METER BOXES
10" W X 19" L X 10" D - CAST IRON - METER BOXES - WITH 40

1 LID AND METER READ HOLE - LEAD FREE NO BID $74.67 Sigma $74.91 SIP
10" W X 19" L X 12" D - CAST IRON - METER BOXES - WITH 300

2 LID AND METER READ HOLE - LEAD FREE NO BID $81.84 Sigma $85.25 SIP
10" W X 19" L X 18" D - CAST IRON - METER BOXES - WITH 25

3 |LUIDAND METER READ HOLE - LEAD FREE NO BID $124.68 Sigma $140.00 SIP
10" X 19" OVAL LIDS ONLY (WATER) - LEAD FREE 100

4 NO BID $24.05 Sigma $28.00 SIP
10" X 19" OVAL LIDS ONLY (SEWER) - LEAD FREE 50

5 NO BID $25.35 Sigma $28.00 SIP
#MB3821 - 10" X 19" OVAL LIDS ONLY (METER READ 300

6 |HOLES)-LEAD FREE NO BID $25.35 Sigma NO BID
13" W X 24" L X 15" D - GREEN PLASTIC (CARSO BROOKS 25

7  |1324) - LEAD FREE NO BID $179.05 Sigma NO BID
VALVE BOXES, RISER, ETC
18" TO 24" VALVE BOX - LEAD FREE 20

8 NO BID $75.08 Sigma $74.00 SIP
24" TO 36" VALVE BOX - LEAD FREE 40

9 NO BID $110.12 Sigma $100.00 SIP
36" TO 48" VALVE BOX - LEAD FREE 50

10 NO BID $137.65 Sigma $127.00 SIP
VALVE BOX LIDS - LEAD FREE 130

11 NO BID $15.85 Sigma $17.00 SIP




1" VALVE BOX RISER - LEAD FREE

12 100 NO BID $10.00 Sigma $22.00 SIP
2" VALVE BOX RISER - LEAD FREE 100

13 NO BID $22.53 Sigma $29.00 SIP
3" VALVE BOX RISER - LEAD FREE 60

14 NO BID $30.03 Sigma $32.81 SIP
4" VALVE BOX RISER - LEAD FREE 60

15 NO BID $43.38 Sigma $41.41 SIP
6" VALVE BOX RISER - LEAD FREE 60

16 NO BID $65.07 Sigma $57.00 SIP
HOSCH SQUARE CONCRETE VALVE BOX PAD - LEAD FREE 50 Hosch

17 NO BID $17.85 Concrete $17.00 SIP
HOSCH SQUARE CONCRETE VALVE MARKER - LEAD FREE 50 Hosch

18 NO BID $17.85 Concrete $17.00 SIP
MEG-A-LUG FOR PVC - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG,
GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS)
3" MEG-A-LUG FOR PVC - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE:

19 |MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) LEAD FREE NO BID $42.59 Sigma $41.41 SIP
4" MEG-A-LUG FOR PVC - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE:

20 |MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) LEAD FREE NO BID $45.84 Sigma $44.56 SIP
6" MEG-A-LUG FOR PVC - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE:

21 MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) LEAD FREE 40 NO BID $57.39 Sigma $55.27 SIP
8" MEG-A-LUG FOR PVC - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE:

22 MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) LEAD FREE 40 NO BID $77.42 Sigma $75.27 SIP
10" MEG-A-LUG FOR PVC - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE:

23 |MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) LEAD FREE 20 NO BID $134.82 Sigma $131.00 SIP
MEG-A-LUG FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - MUST BE KITS (* KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS)
3" MEG-A-LUG FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - MUST BE KITS (*

24 KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) NO BID $36.64 Sigma $34.00 SIP
4" MEG-A-LUG FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - MUST BE KITS (*

25 |KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) NO BID $39.89 Sigma $39.00 SIP
6" MEG-A-LUG FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - MUST BE KITS (*

26 |KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) 60 NO BID $49.27 Sigma $48.00 SIP
8" MEG-A-LUG FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - MUST BE KITS (*

27 |KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) €0 NO BID $67.14 Sigma $65.00 SIP




10" MEG-A-LUG FOR DUCTILE IRON PIPE - MUST BE KITS (*

28 |KITS INCLUDE: MEGA LUG, GASKET, MJ FLANGE AND BOLTS) 20 NO BID $95.48 Sigma $92.00 SIP
MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORY KITS
3" MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORY KITS - LEAD FREE

29 6 NO BID $21.02 Sigma $18.00 SIP
4" MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORY KITS - LEAD FREE

30 6 NO BID $28.89 Sigma $23.00 SIP
6" MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORY KITS - LEAD FREE

31 30 NO BID $39.40 Sigma $32.00 SIP
8" MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORY KITS - LEAD FREE

32 30 NO BID $44.67 Sigma $34.00 SIP
10" MECHANICAL JOINT ACCESSORY KITS - LEAD FREE

33 10 NO BID $64.37 Sigma $50.00 SIP
MECHANICAL JOINT TRANS GASKETS
3" MECHANICAL JOINT TRANS GASKETS - 3.0MJTRANS - LEAD FREE

34 NO BID $5.90 Sigma $6.15 SIP
4" MECHANICAL JOINT TRANS GASKETS - 4.0MJTRANS - LEA

35 10 NO BID $7.56 Sigma $7.00 SIP
6" MECHANICAL JOINT TRANS GASKETS - 6.0MJTRANS - LEA

36 20 NO BID $9.20 Sigma $7.17 SIP
8" MECHANICAL JOINT TRANS GASKETS - 8.0MJTRANS - LEA

37 20 NO BID $12.73 Sigma $10.25 SIP
MECHANICAL JOINT SLEEVE
3" X 12" MECHANICAL JOINT SLEEVE - 3X12MJSLEEVE - LEAD

38 4 NO BID $56.65 Sigma $53.00 SIP
4" X 12" MECHANICAL JOINT SLEEVE - 4X12MJSLEEVE - LEAD

39 6 NO BID $64.35 Sigma $60.00 SIP
6" X 12" MECHANICAL JOINT SLEEVE - 6X12MJSLEEVE - LEAD

40 20 NO BID $107.80 Sigma $100.00 SIP
8" X 12" MECHANICAL JOINT SLEEVE - 8X12MJSLEEVE - LEAD

41 20 NO BID $173.25 Sigma $161.00 SIP

MECHANICAL JOINT 22 1/2 DEGREE FTG




6" MECHANICAL JOINT 22 1/2 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

42 5 NO BID $87.45 Sigma $81.50 SIP
8" MECHANICAL JOINT 22 1/2 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

43 5 NO BID $136.95 Sigma | $128.00 | SIP
MECHANICAL JOINT 45 DEGREE FTG
6" MECHANICAL JOINT 45 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

44 5 NO BID $96.25 Sigma $96.37 sIP
8" MECHANICAL JOINT 45 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

45 5 NO BID $140.25 Sigma | $130.00 | SIP
4" MECHANICAL JOINT 45 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

46 5 NO BID $60.50 Sigma $56.37 SIP
MECHANICAL JOINT 90 DEGREE FTG
4" MECHANICAL JOINT 90 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

47 2 NO BID $72.60 Sigma $67.65 SIP
6" MECHANICAL JOINT 90 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

48 10 NO BID $118.80 Sigma | $110.00 | SIP
8" MECHANICAL JOINT 90 DEGREE FTG - LEAD FREE

49 10 NO BID $171.60 Sigma | $180.00 | SIP
HYDRANT TEE
6" X 6" HYDRANT TEE - 6X6HYDTEE - LEAD FREE

50 6 NO BID $196.35 Sigma | $180.00 | SIP
8" X 6" HYDRANT TEE - 8X6HYDTEE - LEAD FREE

51 6 NO BID $245.85 Sigma | $229.00 | SIP
10" X 6" HYDRANT TEE - 10X6HYDTEE - LEAD FREE

52 2 NO BID $311.30 Sigma | $290.00 | SIP
MECHANICAL JOINT PLUGS
4" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUGS - 4.0MJPLUG - LEAD FREE

53 5 NO BID $34.10 Sigma $32.00 SIP
6" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUGS - 6.0MJPLUG - LEAD FREE

54 5 NO BID $63.80 Sigma $60.00 SIP
8" MECHANICAL JOINT PLUGS - 8.0MJPLUG - LEAD FREE

55 5 NO BID $94.05 Sigma $88.00 SIP




INSERTS & METER COUPLINGS

3/4" PLASTIC INSERTS CTS

2000 Mars Water

56 $0.21 Blue $0.35 Mars NO BID
1" PLASTIC INSERTS CTS 1000 Mars Water

57 $0.24 Blue $0.45 Mars NO BID
2" STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS CTS - 6133T ( AY MCDONALD ) 50 AY Ford Meter

58 $2.57 McDonald $2.80 Box NO BID
2" STAINLESS STEEL INSERTS IPS - 6137 ( AY MCDONALD ) 50 AY Ford Meter

59 $4.85 McDonald $4.26 Box NO BID
3/4X12 METER COUPLINGS (LEAD FREE) — 74620 ( AY MCDO] 150 AY Ford Meter

60 $54.49 McDonald $65.79 Box NO BID
1X12 METER COUPLINGS (LEAD FREE) — 74620 ( AY MCDONA . AY Ford Meter

61 $73.74 McDonald $62.39 Box NO BID
3/4X2 METER COUPLINGS (LEAD FREE) — 74620 ( AY MCDON 100 AY Ford Meter

62 $10.33 McDonald $69.11 Box NO BID
LEAD FREE PARTS (BACKFLOW)

$0.00 $0.00

3/4" AY MCDONALD 711X-3JF 43 INLINE DUAL CHECK 3000 AY AY

63 |VALVE MSXFP ( NO SUBSTITUTIONS) $30.35 McDonald $46.65 McDonald [ NO BID
11/4" X 1" WILKINS 700XL INLINE DUAL CHECK MS X FP -

64 $37.49 Wilkins $54.29 Wilkins NO BID
3/4" WILKINS 950XL T2 DOUBLE CHECK 100

65 $149.00 Wilkins $186.30 Wilkins NO BID
1" WILKINS 950XL T2 DOUBLE CHECK 20

66 $158.00 Wilkins $198.45 Wilkins NO BID
11/2" WILKINS 950XL T2 DOUBLE CHECK .

67 $340.00 Wilkins $441.45 Wilkins NO BID
2" WILKINS 950XL T2 DOUBLE CHECK 10

68 $476.00 Wilkins $602.10 Wilkins NO BID




